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If you are seeking advice for increasing the borrowing secured on a property which is subject to an existing 
mortgage, we will consider whether you should: 
 

• take a further advance/additional borrowing from your current lender 

• take out a new mortgage with a different lender 
 

We will not consider second charge loans or unsecured lending. In some circumstances, these options might be 
available and appropriate for you.   
___________________________________________________________________________________________

___ 

Borrowing into retirement   
___________________________________________________________________________________________

___ 

We can offer advice on a number of products where you are considering borrowing on an interest-only basis into 
your retirement.  
 
Where you are borrowing on this basis, a Lifetime Mortgage might be more suitable option for you than traditional 
mortgages.  
 
A Lifetime Mortgage might be a more suitable option for you. A Lifetime Mortgage is a type of loan which does not 
need to be repaid until you die, sell the property or go into long-term care and where the interest is usually rolled up 
into the loan instead of being repaid each month.  
 
We do not offer advice on Lifetime Mortgages, however we can introduce you to an appropriately qualified adviser 
if you wish to consider this option. 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Your duty to provide full and accurate information     

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
It is your responsibility to provide full and accurate information to us and to any product provider or lender that we 
might recommend.  
 
Failure to disclose material information could invalidate any recommended insurance or could result in a mortgage 
application being declined.  
 
We rely on the information you have disclosed to us. We cannot be held responsible for any consequences arising 
from the information held on your file becoming inaccurate as a result of changes that you have not told us about.  
 
 

3. Our Fees and Charge 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

What are our Fees and Charges?     

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Insurance 

We will not charge you a fee for our services relating to insurance but we will receive commission from the product 

provider. The commission will be calculated as a proportion of the premiums paid for the insurance product. 

You will receive a quotation which will tell you about the fees and charges relating to any particular insurance policy 
that we recommend. 

Mortgages 

For our mortgage advice services, we will charge a fee of between £0 and maximum of 2% of the mortgage 
advance up to maximum of £5,000.  

Our fees vary according to complexity of individual circumstances such as, but not limited to, adverse credit, debt 
consolidation, schemes (e.g shared ownership, right to buy, First Homes).  

Our fees and charges will be explained before we do any work, and we will explain payment options to you.  
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We charge a fee for arranging your mortgage, per mortgage, which is agreed upon before we undertake any 
chargeable work.  

This will be provided to you in writing prior to any commencement of work and at what stage the fees are due. 

The fee for your application is £________. The payments are due as detailed below:  

£__________ payable on application 

£__________ payable at offer  

Example on fee charge at a percentage basis (for illustrative purposes only): 
If your mortgage is for £100,000, we may charge up to £2,000 in total, which equates to 2% of the loan.  

There may be additional costs and charges relating to the mortgage product we recommend. You will receive a 
Mortgage Illustration when considering a particular mortgage and product, which will detail any fees relating to it.  

If you would like to see a list of the commission rates payable by the mortgage lenders we have access to, please 
ask your adviser. The precise amount paid by the lender recommended to you will be detailed in the Mortgage 
Illustration which we will give to you.  

(Refunds)  

We do not offer a refund of mortgage fees.  

(Procuration Fee) 

We will also be paid a procuration fee from the lender. The amount of the procuration fee will be disclosed to you. 

 
You have the right to ask us to provide information on the range of procuration fees that the lenders on our panels 
offer to us. 
 
If an application is submitted to a lender via a packager we will be paid commission by the packager. This will be 
disclosed to you. 
 

4. Complaints 
___________________________________________________________________________________________

___ 

What to do if you have a complaint? 

___________________________________________________________________________________________

___ 

We hope that you will be satisfied with the service that we provide.  If you wish to register a complaint, please contact 
us via any of the following methods: 

In Writing: The Customer Resolution Team, PRIMIS Mortgage Network, 3700 Parkside, 

Birmingham Business Park, Solihull. West Midlands. B37 7YT. 

By Telephone:              0121 767 1139 

By Email:  complaints.solihull@primis.co.uk 

PRIMIS will aim to deal with your complaint quickly and impartially. You can see our full complaints procedures via 

our website www.primis.co.uk and following the links for Customer Complaints from the home page. If we cannot 

resolve your complaint to your satisfaction, you may be entitled to refer it to the Financial Ombudsman Service.   

Full details can be found on its website at www.financial-ombudsman.org.uk 

http://www.primis.co.uk/
http://www.financial-ombudsman.org.uk/
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